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APPOINTMENT OF GROUP MANAGING DIRECTOR  
 

Synergie Cad Strengthens Leadership with Nomination of  
Krishna Sreerambhatla as Managing Director 

 
 
 
Carros, France – July 3, 2025 – Synergie Cad Group, a leading provider of semiconductor 
test interface solutions with testing and packaging capabilities, today announced the 
nomination of Krishna Sreerambhatla as its new Managing Director.  
This strategic appointment underscores Synergie Cad's commitment to accelerating its growth 
and strengthening its market position. Krishna will assume full responsibilities of CEO and 
Managing Director at the end of 2025, succeeding Alain Librati, the esteemed founder and 
CEO of Synergie Cad, who will ensure a smooth handover throughout the remainder of the 
year. 
Krishna Sreerambhatla will be responsible for leading Synergie Cad in executing its strategy 
to become a global leader in semiconductor test consumables and equipment space. This will 
involve leveraging the company's unique capabilities in test engineering and driving new 
initiatives to meet evolving industry demands. 
  
With over 27 years of experience in the semiconductor device and semiconductor equipment 
sector, Krishna brings a wealth of expertise in both technical innovation and strategic 
leadership. Prior to joining Synergie Cad, Krishna held numerous key leadership roles at NXP, 
ASML, Applied Materials, and ASM international where he led cross functional global teams 
and played a key role in driving substantial growth through geographical sales expansion, 
product development, product marketing, scaling operational scaling, and fostering strategic 
partnerships 
 
"We're incredibly pleased to welcome Krishna to Synergie Cad," said Alain Librati, founder 
and CEO of Synergie Cad Group. “His leadership, deep industry knowledge, and commitment 
to innovation align perfectly with our vision for Synergie Cad's future. We are confident that 
Krishna will play a pivotal role in guiding the company through its next phase of growth and 
success. I look forward to working closely with him during the transition to ensure continued 
momentum and success.” 
 
"Krishna's extensive experience and proven track record in the semiconductor industry make 
him the ideal leader to drive Synergie Cad's strategic initiatives" said Christophe Duverne, 
Chairman of the Board. “His appointment marks a pivotal moment as we accelerate our journey 
to become a global leader in semiconductor test consumables, further solidifying our 
commitment to innovation and customer success. The Board is also incredibly grateful to Alain 
Librati, Synergie Cad's founder and CEO, for his immense contributions and looks forward to 
a successful transition period." 
 
 
"I am honored to be appointed as Managing Director of Synergie Cad," said Krishna 
Sreerambhatla. "Synergie Cad has a strong legacy of innovation and a highly skilled team 
dedicated to solving the most complex challenges in test engineering. I am excited to 
collaborate with Alain and the entire organization to deliver differentiated solutions that enable 



 

  

 

our customer roadmaps and solidify Synergie Cad's position as a trusted partner in the 
industry. Ensuring a smooth transition and uninterrupted operations for our customers, 
suppliers and ecosystem partners will remain a top priority." 
 
 
About Synergie Cad Group 
 
Founded in 1986 and based in Carros, France, Synergie Cad Group is a leading European 
provider of semiconductor test consumables. The company offers a wide range of services, 
including design of complex test interface boards, probe cards, burn-in boards, burn-in ovens, 
and test and packaging services. With operations across Europe, Asia, and North America, 
the company is renowned for its quality, reliability, and customized products, serving a diverse 
range of applications in the semiconductor industry. 
 
synergie-cad.com  
 
Follow Synergie Cad Group on  

https://www.linkedin.com/company/synergie-cad/?viewAsMember=true

